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FOI: 402 02 25
Request Theme: Wildfire Response Planning
Reporting Period: 01 April 2019 — 31 March 2024
Question Response

1. Please would you a) list the five
biggest landowners in your area in
terms of hectares they manage
and

b) where these landowners have
submitted a Wildfire Response
Plan, the latest version of it
together with any Risk
Assessment they have provided.

a) Hereford and Worcester Fire and Rescue Service (The Service) does not hold the requested
information.

b) The Service has not received any Wildfire Response Plans from landowners.

2. Provide your own Risk
Assessment as a Fire and Rescue
Service on the threats facing your
firefighters in tackling moorland
fires.

While the Service does not hold a separate risk assessment specially in relation to tackling

moorland fires, crews would follow the National Fire Chiefs Council’s protocols when responding to

wildfires.
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